








SEATTLE COMMUNITY POLICE COMMISSION 

STATEMENT OF INTENTION  
TO CONTINUE SERVICE AS COMMISSIONER 
 

VIA HAND DELIVERY 

 

TO:  MAYOR EDWARD MURRAY 
  COUNCIL PRESIDENT BRUCE HARRELL 
  COMMUNITY POLICE COMMISSION EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR FE LOPEZ 
 

In accordance with Section 39 of Ordinance 125315, an ordinance relating to civilian and 
community oversight of the police; adding a new Chapter 3.29 to the Seattle Municipal Code 
(SMC); recodifying Subchapters VII, VIII, and IX of Chapter 3.28 of the SMC as Subchapters I, II, 
and III of Chapter 3.29; amending or repealing sections in Chapters 3.28, 4.08, and 14.12 of the 
SMC; and concerning Ordinance 118482, Commissioner Lisa Daugaard hereby states the 
intention to continue service on the Community Police Commission after the effective date of 
Ordinance 125315. 

Commissioner Daugaard meets the qualifications of Section 3.29.340 of the Seattle Municipal 
Code.  She helped found in 1998 and for many years (from 2001-2013) supervised the Racial 
Disparity Project (RDP) at the Defender Association (TDA), a unit within a non-profit public 
defense law office dedicated to reducing racial inequities in the justice system, with specific 
focus on policing and police accountability.  In her role at the RDP, she provided legal counsel 
and technical assistance to the Minority Executive Directors’ Coalition Multiracial Task Force on 
Police Accountability and Racial Profiling, helping to develop and advocacy for changes in the 
system of police oversight in place in Seattle from 2002-2013 when the MEDC Task Force 
disbanded.  She and the RDP under her supervision also provided technical advice and legal 
support to community-based organizations in racially and ethnically diverse communities 
focused on improving policing in Seattle.  She was the lead litigator in an 8 year challenge to 
racial disparity in Seattle drug arrests which ultimately resolved in the creation of the LEAD 
police diversion program, which refers drug-involved suspects to community-based case 
management rather than jail and prosecution.  The RDP provided substantial data and 
connected the US Attorney’s Office and the Department of Justice with many community-based 
contacts and witnesses during the 2011 investigation which led to the SPD consent decree. 

 

Her representation of a defendant in 2007-2008 in which an involved officer had been involved 
in and not disciplined for serious prior misconduct (the “Patterson case” in 2007) led directly to 
the formation of Mayor Nickels’ 2008 Blue Ribbon Task Force on Police Accountability, which 



identified specific process changes in the accountability system which were for the most part 
later adopted. 

Daugaard has received recognition and honors for her representation and partnership with 
Seattle’s diverse communities in seeking police and justice system reform, including awards 
from El Centro de la Raza (Roberto Maestas Award in 2014 with Diane Narasaki for work as co-
chairs of the Community Police Commission ); Real Change in 2013 (Change Maker Award for 
advancing the interests of people experiencing homelessness through effective police reform); 
Mothers for Police Accountability (award to the Racial Disparity Project in 2002 under 
Daugaard’s supervision) and the Paul Allen Foundation (2013 Creative Leadership Award for 
work establishing the LEAD police diversion program).   

The Public Defender Association under Daugaard’s direction is the project manager for LEAD, 
which requires working in close partnership with and maintaining credibility and good faith with 
community public safety advocates, police leaders and officers and prosecutors, as well as 
harm-reduction oriented human services providers and civil rights advocates.  PDA was a 
founding participant in the Center City Initiative, a partnership between 2013-present among 
business and neighborhood leaders, civil rights leaders and human services providers to find 
common ground in the quest to advance public order and safety through improved delivery of 
services and care coordination for people experiencing behavioral health issues and extreme 
poverty, as well as enhancing policing capacity and services.   

Prior to joining TDA in 1996, Daugaard was Legal Director at the Coalition for the Homeless in 
New York City, where she did litigation and policy advocacy advancing the rights and interests 
of those experiencing homelessness in New York, with particular focus on interactions between 
police forces and para-police groups and people who were homeless in public spaces.  She was 
for many years (2002-2013 and again from 204-2015) a supervisor and manager in the King 
County public defense program.  She supervises a large unit defending misdemeanor 
defendants in Seattle Municipal Court, where nearly all cases originated in interaction between 
the defendant and officers of the Seattle Police Department.  For her entire practice as a public 
defender and defender supervisor, the majority of SMC defendants and the majority of those 
represented by TDA in SMC were people of color. 

She has substantial civil rights litigation experience, both before and after joining TDA in 1996. 
Under her supervision, PDA recently was co-counsel in successful litigation securing a 
permanent injunction against Western State Hospital for excessive delays in admitting in-
custody mentally ill defendants for competency evaluation and restoration.  She was counsel in 
successful litigation seeking access to public parks and other public property for First 
Amendment activities in 2000, 2011 and 2012, and led a successful effort for emergency 
injunctive relief requiring access to counsel for individuals in prolonged SPD custody during the 
WTO demonstrations in 1999.  She led a lawsuit securing a permanent injunction against 
Amtrak Police for violation of the civil rights of homeless people present in Penn Station in New 
York City in 1995 and fair labor standards act litigation against a business improvement district 



in New York City from 1994-1996.  PDA frequently successfully litigates Public Records Act cases 
for failure of Washington State police departments to provide public records in response to 
public records requests. 

Daugaard has substantial labor law expertise, having negotiated collective bargaining 
agreements both as a private employer at TDA and as Deputy Director of the King County 
Department of Public Defense in 2014-2015 (a first contract for both the DPD management 
union and rank and file union).   

Daugaard is a graduate of an accredited law school (Yale Law School class of 1992) and is a 
member in good standing of the Washington State Bar Association. 

Daugaard has significant civic and work ties in Seattle City Council Districts 2, 3, 4, 6 and 7, 
through work on police diversion and neighborhood public order and public safety issues at the 
Public Defender Association (which is located in District 7).  She and PDA are beginning more 
extensive work in Districts 1 and 5 as well in 2017.  

Respectfully submitted this 27th day of June, 2017. 

 

_____________________________ 
Lisa Daugaard 
Commissioner, Seattle Community Police Commission 

 

(Key ordinance provisions on back of this page.) 






