




















http://www.legistar.com/












http://www.legistar.com/












http://www.legistar.com/














http://www.legistar.com/










http://www.legistar.com/














http://www.legistar.com/












































































































































































































































































































































































































































































http://www.legistar.com/


http://www.legistar.com/


http://www.legistar.com/




















http://www.legistar.com/












































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































http://www.legistar.com/


http://www.legistar.com/












http://www.legistar.com/






























































































































































http://www.legistar.com/












































































































































































Ketil Freeman 
Land Use Committee 
March 28, 2025 
D#1a 
 

3 
 

 
* * * 

926



Ketil Freeman 
Land Use Committee 
March 28, 2025 
D#1a 
 

4 
 

 

927



Date (xx/xx/xxxx) Department Name Page Number
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections

Interim Street Activation 
Legislation
April 2, 2025

928



Date (xx/xx/xxxx) Department Name Page Number
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections

Purpose and Goals
• Help fill vacant spaces

• Broaden the range of potential new 
tenants

• Attract more daily activity and eyes on 
the street – add more vitality

• Promote creativity and entrepreneurship 
by allowing new types of businesses

929



Date (xx/xx/xxxx) Department Name Page Number
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections

What the Data Shows

• Downtown business openings and closures:

• Nov ’23 to March ’24:     9 openings and 21 closures
• 2020 to 2021:               102 openings and 161 closures 

• Foot traffic is still regaining year-over-year, but pace is slowing:

• 2022 – 2023:   +10 - 15% (comparing same months)

• 2023 – 2024:   +5%           (       ”              ”           ”       )

Source: DSA, 2024

930



Date (xx/xx/xxxx) Department Name Page Number
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections

Proposal

• Interim legislation:  in place for 3 years

• Applies to Class I & II Pedestrian Streets with street-level use 
requirements – Map of streets shown later in presentation

• Provide more code flexibility and reduce barriers:

• Allow greater variety of ground-floor and 2nd-floor uses

• Encourage creative floor plans

• Maintain exemptions from density limits

• New uses can remain after the interim period, and may revert to prior 
uses

931



Date (xx/xx/xxxx) Department Name Page Number
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections

Comparison of Uses Allowed

Existing allowed uses limited to following: Proposed additional interim uses:

Arts facilities, entertainment uses: recreational, athletic, 
theaters, lecture halls, libraries, parks

Arts installations, Custom & craft work:  glassblowing, 
printing, motion picture studios, pottery, sculpture, other 
personal or household items, parks

General sales and services, retail major durables sales (such 
as furniture)

Sales and services, non-household: such as restaurant 
supply, business support services

Restaurants: eating and drinking Food: food and beverage production, commissary kitchens, 
catering services

Human services, child care, religious facilities, museums, low-
income housing (Seattle Mixed)

Medical services: doctors, dentists, vets, chiropractic

Institutional uses: community centers and support services, 
community clubs, institutes of advanced study

Offices and R&D laboratories

Drawn from uses allowed in pedestrian-oriented neighborhood business districts

932



Date (xx/xx/xxxx) Department Name Page Number
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections

Small Spaces are Activators

• People create the daily life 
that animates the city

• Allow more small 
businesses by reducing 
required dimensions at 
street-level

933



Date (xx/xx/xxxx) Department Name Page Number
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections

Flexibility For Multi-level Destination Uses

• Interior design flexibility to 
encourage creative layouts, such 
as multi-floor street-level uses

934



Date (xx/xx/xxxx) Department Name Page Number
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections

Downtown
Downtown Map 1G:

-- The proposal applies to the outlined streets. 

-- Existing street level use requirements proposed 
to be maintained on the streets mapped as 

All streets shown are “Class I pedestrian” designated
or Green Streets

935



Date (xx/xx/xxxx) Department Name Page Number
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections

South Lake Union

(Class I)

Existing requirements proposed to 

be maintained

936



Date (xx/xx/xxxx) Department Name Page Number
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections

South Lake Union 
proposed map
amendment

937



Date (xx/xx/xxxx) Department Name Page Number
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections

Uptown

Existing requirements proposed to 

be maintained

938



Date (xx/xx/xxxx) Department Name Page Number
Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections

Questions?

Gordon Clowers, SDCI Senior Urban Planner

gordon.clowers@seattle.gov

www.seattle.gov/sdci

939



SEATTLE CITY COUNCIL

Legislation Text

600 Fourth Ave. 2nd Floor
Seattle, WA 98104

File #: CB 120948, Version: 1

CITY OF SEATTLE

ORDINANCE __________________

COUNCIL BILL __________________

AN ORDINANCE relating to Seattle’s construction codes; allowing for the extension of certain projects and
building permits; amending Sections 106.6.10, 106.9, and 106.10 of the Seattle Building Code, adopted
by Ordinance 127108.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF SEATTLE AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 106.6.10 of the Seattle Building Code, enacted by Ordinance 127108, is amended as

follows:

106.6.10 Extensions prior to permit issuance. At the discretion of the building official, applications for

projects that require more than 12 months to review and approve may be extended for a period that provides

reasonable time to complete the review and approval, but in no case longer than 24 months from the date of the

original application. No application may be extended more than once. After cancellation, the applicant shall

submit a new application and pay a new fee to restart the permit process.

Notwithstanding other provisions of this code, applications may be extended where issuance of the

permit is delayed by litigation, preparation of environmental impact statements, appeals, strikes or other causes

related to the application that are beyond the applicant’s control, or while the applicant is making progress

toward issuance of a master use permit.

Notwithstanding other provisions of this code, if an applicant requests an extension prior to November

12, 2024 for an application subject to a version of the Seattle Building Code based on amendments to the 2015

or 2018 International Building Code, and the applicant claims a hardship related to securing construction or

permanent financing, the building official shall extend the application for 24 months in addition to any

SEATTLE CITY COUNCIL Printed on 3/31/2025Page 1 of 4

powered by Legistar™940

http://www.legistar.com/


File #: CB 120948, Version: 1

extensions authorized under this Section 106.6.10.

Section 2. Section 106.9 of the Seattle Building Code, enacted by Ordinance 127108, is amended as

follows:

106.9 Expiration of permits. Authority to do the work authorized by a permit expires 18 months from the date

of issuance. ((An)) Except as provided in Item 3.4 of Section 106.10, an approved renewal extends the life of a

permit for an additional 18 months from the prior expiration date. An approved reestablishment extends the life

of the permit for 18 months from the date the permit expired.

Exceptions:

1. Initial permits for major construction projects that require more than 18 months to complete

may be issued for a period that provides reasonable time to complete the work, according to an approved

construction schedule. The building official may authorize a permit expiration date not to exceed three years

from the date of issuance, except when there is an associated Shoreline Substantial Development permit in

which case the building official may authorize an expiration date not to exceed the life of the Shoreline permit.

2. The building official may issue permits which expire in less than 18 months if the building

official determines a shorter period is appropriate to complete the work.

This section is subject to the limitations in Seattle Municipal Code Section 22.800.100, Stormwater

Code.

Section 3. Section 106.10 of the Seattle Building Code, enacted by Ordinance 127108, is amended as

follows:

106.10 Renewal of permits. Permits may be renewed and renewed permits may be further renewed by the

building official if the following conditions are met:

1. Application for renewal is made within the 30-day period immediately preceding the date of

expiration of the permit; and

2. If the project has had an associated discretionary Land Use review, the land use approval has not

SEATTLE CITY COUNCIL Printed on 3/31/2025Page 2 of 4

powered by Legistar™941

http://www.legistar.com/


File #: CB 120948, Version: 1

expired; and

3. If an application for renewal is made more than 18 months after the date of mandatory compliance

with a new or revised edition of the Seattle Building Code, the permit shall not be renewed unless:

 3.1. The building official determines that the permit complies, or is modified to comply, with

the Seattle Building, Mechanical, Fuel Gas, Energy, Stormwater, Side Sewer and Grading codes in effect on the

date of application for renewal; or

3.2. The work authorized by the permit is substantially underway and progressing at a rate

approved by the building official. “Substantially underway” means that normally required building inspections

have been approved for work such as foundations, framing, mechanical, insulation and finish work that is being

completed on a continuing basis; or

3.3. Commencement or completion of the work authorized by the permit is delayed by litigation,

appeals, strikes, or other extraordinary circumstances related to the work authorized by the permit, beyond the

permit holder’s control, subject to the approval of the building official; or

3.4. The permit was issued under a version of the Seattle Building Code based on amendments

to the 2015 or 2018 International Building Code, application for renewal is made prior to November 12, 2024,

and the applicant claims a hardship related to securing construction or permanent financing, in which case the

building official shall renew the permit for an additional 24 months; and

4. The permit shall not be renewed unless: (a) the building official determines that the permit complies,

or is modified to comply, with the Seattle Stormwater Code in effect on the date of application for renewal; or

(b) construction has started. For purposes of this provision, “started construction” means the site work

associated with and directly related to the approved project has begun. For example, grading the project site to

final grade or utility installation constitutes the start of construction; simply clearing the project site does not.

Section 5. This ordinance shall take effect as provided by Seattle Municipal Code Sections 1.04.020 and

1.04.070.

SEATTLE CITY COUNCIL Printed on 3/31/2025Page 3 of 4

powered by Legistar™942

http://www.legistar.com/


File #: CB 120948, Version: 1

Passed by the City Council the ________ day of _________________________, 2025, and signed by

me in open session in authentication of its passage this ________ day of _________________________, 2025.

____________________________________

President ____________ of the City Council

Approved / returned unsigned / vetoed this _____ day of _________________, 2025.

____________________________________

Bruce A. Harrell, Mayor

Filed by me this ________ day of _________________________, 2025.

____________________________________

Scheereen Dedman, City Clerk

(Seal)

SEATTLE CITY COUNCIL Printed on 3/31/2025Page 4 of 4

powered by Legistar™943

http://www.legistar.com/


Kye Lee 
MO Building Code Permit Extension SUM 

D1a 

1 
Template last revised: December 9, 2024 

SUMMARY and FISCAL NOTE 

Department: Dept. Contact: CBO Contact: 

Mayor’s Office Kye Lee Christie Parker 

 

1. BILL SUMMARY 

 

Legislation Title: AN ORDINANCE relating to Seattle’s construction codes; allowing for the 

extension of certain projects and building permits; amending Sections 106.6.10, 106.9, and 

106.10 of the Seattle Building Code, adopted by Ordinance 127108.  

 

Summary and Background of the Legislation: This legislation allows building permit 

applicants an additional 24-month extension on existing permit applications and issued permits 

for projects vested to the 2015 or 2018 Seattle Building Code requirements.  Projects with permit 

applications vested to the 2015 or 2018 codes would need significant redesign should their 

applications or permits expire and more recent Seattle Building Code provisions be applied to the 

project; the redesign could add significant cost to the project.   

 

The Seattle Building Code aims to ensure the health, safety, and well-being of occupants and the 

public.  It and other codes are updated from time to time to address new technologies, safety 

improvements, and construction methods.   

 

Currently, projects working through the process have 24 months to complete the review and 

approval process before they must restart, unless additional extensions are granted for causes that 

are beyond the applicants’ control.  Similarly, once permits are issued, they are valid for 18 

months and may be renewed for an additional 18 months.   

 

In order for vested projects to be eligible for extension under this legislation, property owners 

must attest that the project has been stalled due to financing issues and must have requested an 

extension prior to November 12, 2024 (the effective date of the 2024 Seattle Building Code per 

Ordinance 127108).  There are more than 3,000 distinct project addresses with projects vested to 

the 2015 and 2018 codes that could be extended by this legislation.  These projects include an 

estimated 34,000 housing units.  The Mayor’s Office is aware of 15 projects, mostly located 

downtown, that could move forward if this legislation were to pass.  

 

2. CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM 

Does this legislation create, fund, or amend a CIP Project?   Yes  No  

 

3. SUMMARY OF FINANCIAL IMPLICATIONS 

 

Does this legislation have financial impacts to the City?   Yes  No 

 

See note on City revenues in Section 3.b below. 

944



Kye Lee 
MO Building Code Permit Extension SUM 

D1a 

2 
Template last revised: December 9, 2024 

 

3.a. Appropriations 

 

 This legislation adds, changes, or deletes appropriations. 
 

3.b. Revenues/Reimbursements 

 This legislation adds, changes, or deletes revenues or reimbursements. 
 

Revenue/Reimbursement Notes: The Mayor’s Office is aware of approximately 15 projects 

that vested under prior codes that could potentially move forward if they were to receive 

additional permit extensions.  These projects represent approximately $13.4 million of sales tax 

revenue to the City and an estimated maximum of $75 million in mandatory housing 

affordability (MHA) fees; they could also produce additional but undetermined incentive zone 

payments as well as real estate excise tax and business and occupation tax revenue.  MHA 

payments are adjusted annually for inflation and are assessed at the time the project vests.  The 

extension could result in MHA revenues due to having projects continue rather than being 

cancelled. Although fee adjustments may have led to higher revenues if a project(s) reapplied for 

a new permit in the future, there is a low likelihood that projects would move forward without 

the extension provided by this legislation and in that event, the City would receive no revenue 

from cancelled projects.  Extending the permitting timeline will increase the chances of these 

projects being constructed. 

 

3.c. Positions 

 This legislation adds, changes, or deletes positions. 
 

3.d. Other Impacts 

 

Does the legislation have other financial impacts to The City of Seattle, including direct or 

indirect, one-time or ongoing costs, that are not included in Sections 3.a through 3.c? If so, 

please describe these financial impacts. 

No. 

 

If the legislation has costs, but they can be absorbed within existing operations, please 

describe how those costs can be absorbed. The description should clearly describe if the 

absorbed costs are achievable because the department had excess resources within their 

existing budget or if by absorbing these costs the department is deprioritizing other work 

that would have used these resources.  

N/A 

 

Please describe any financial costs or other impacts of not implementing the legislation. 

See note on City revenues in Section 3.b. above. 

 

945



Kye Lee 
MO Building Code Permit Extension SUM 

D1a 

3 
Template last revised: December 9, 2024 

4. OTHER IMPLICATIONS 

a. Please describe how this legislation may affect any departments besides the originating 

department. 

The Seattle Department of Construction and Inspections manages the review and approval 

process for construction permitting. 

 

The Office of Housing coordinates with developers to ensure compliance with the MHA 

Program. 

 

b. Does this legislation affect a piece of property? If yes, please attach a map and explain 

any impacts on the property. Please attach any Environmental Impact Statements, 

Determinations of Non-Significance, or other reports generated for this property.  

No, this legislation does not affect a particular piece of property. 

 

c. Please describe any perceived implication for the principles of the Race and Social 

Justice Initiative.  

 

i. How does this legislation impact vulnerable or historically disadvantaged 

communities? How did you arrive at this conclusion? In your response please 

consider impacts within City government (employees, internal programs) as well 

as in the broader community.  

There are projects vested to the 2015 and 2018 codes for housing that serve these 

communities that would be costly to update to the 2021 code.  The updated costs 

could increase the cost of housing which would be passed onto these communities. 

However, updating projects to current codes would ensure that those communities 

benefit from enhanced accessibility requirements, electric vehicle charging 

requirements, and seismic design standards as required by current code.  

 

ii. Please attach any Racial Equity Toolkits or other racial equity analyses in the 

development and/or assessment of the legislation. 

N/A 

 

iii. What is the Language Access Plan for any communications to the public? 

N/A 

 

d. Climate Change Implications  

 

i. Emissions: How is this legislation likely to increase or decrease carbon emissions 

in a material way? Please attach any studies or other materials that were used to 

inform this response.  

This legislation will increase carbon emissions since some building decarbonization 

methods would not be incorporated on projects vested to the 2015 or 2018 codes; 

however, these buildings would still be efficient by national standards.  Bringing 

housing to city centers plays a crucial role in reducing emissions by promoting 

proximity between where people live, work, and access services.  

 

946



Kye Lee 
MO Building Code Permit Extension SUM 

D1a 

4 
Template last revised: December 9, 2024 

ii. Resiliency: Will the action(s) proposed by this legislation increase or decrease 

Seattle’s resiliency (or ability to adapt) to climate change in a material way? If 

so, explain. If it is likely to decrease resiliency in a material way, describe what 

will or could be done to mitigate the effects.  

For those projects vested to the 2015 or 2018 codes, this legislation will decrease 

Seattle’s ability to adapt to climate change through the increased energy efficient 

construction standards; however, resiliency is unlikely to be materially impacted by 

this legislation.  

 

e. If this legislation includes a new initiative or a major programmatic expansion: What 

are the specific long-term and measurable goal(s) of the program? How will this 

legislation help achieve the program’s desired goal(s)? What mechanisms will be used 

to measure progress towards meeting those goals? 

N/A 

 

5. CHECKLIST 

 

 Is a public hearing required? 

 

 Is publication of notice with The Daily Journal of Commerce and/or The Seattle 

Times required? 

 

 If this legislation changes spending and/or revenues for a fund, have you reviewed 

the relevant fund policies and determined that this legislation complies?  

 

 Does this legislation create a non-utility CIP project that involves a shared financial 

commitment with a non-City partner agency or organization?  

 

6. ATTACHMENTS 

 

Summary Attachments: None. 

 

 

947



Ketil Freeman 
Land Use Committee 
March 28, 2025 
D#1a 
 

1 
 

 

Amendment 1 Version #1 to CB 120948 – Date Correction 

Sponsor: Councilmember Solomon 

Date Correction 
 

Effect: Council Bill (CB) 120948 would allow an applicant for eligible projects to request an 
extension or renewal of 24 months for a building permit based on a claim that development is 
precluded by financial hardship. 

This amendment would correct an error in the legislation that set a date for requesting the 
extension or renewal of November 12, 2024.  The amendment would change that date to 
November 1, 2026, which was the intended date.  November 1, 2026, is the targeted date for 
the next update to Seattle’s construction codes. 

 

Amend Sections 1 and 3 of CB 120948 as follows: 

Section 1. Section 106.6.10 of the Seattle Building Code, enacted by Ordinance 127108, 

is amended as follows: 

106.6.10 Extensions prior to permit issuance. At the discretion of the building official, 

applications for projects that require more than 12 months to review and approve may be 

extended for a period that provides reasonable time to complete the review and approval, but in 

no case longer than 24 months from the date of the original application. No application may be 

extended more than once. After cancellation, the applicant shall submit a new application and 

pay a new fee to restart the permit process. 

Notwithstanding other provisions of this code, applications may be extended where issuance of 

the permit is delayed by litigation, preparation of environmental impact statements, appeals, 

948



Ketil Freeman 
Land Use Committee 
March 28, 2025 
D#1a 
 

2 
 

strikes or other causes related to the application that are beyond the applicant’s control, or while 

the applicant is making progress toward issuance of a master use permit. 

Notwithstanding other provisions of this code, if an applicant requests an extension prior to 

November 12, 2024 2026 for an application subject to a version of the Seattle Building Code 

based on amendments to the 2015 or 2018 International Building Code, and the applicant claims 

a hardship related to securing construction or permanent financing, the building official shall 

extend the application for 24 months in addition to any extensions authorized under this Section 

106.6.10. 

Section 3. Section 106.10 of the Seattle Building Code, enacted by Ordinance 127108, is 

amended as follows: 

106.10 Renewal of permits. Permits may be renewed and renewed permits may be further 

renewed by the building official if the following conditions are met: 

1. Application for renewal is made within the 30-day period immediately preceding the date of 

expiration of the permit; and 

2. If the project has had an associated discretionary Land Use review, the land use approval has 

not expired; and 

3. If an application for renewal is made more than 18 months after the date of mandatory 

compliance with a new or revised edition of the Seattle Building Code, the permit shall not be 

renewed unless: 

949



Ketil Freeman 
Land Use Committee 
March 28, 2025 
D#1a 
 

3 
 

 3.1. The building official determines that the permit complies, or is modified to comply, with the 

Seattle Building, Mechanical, Fuel Gas, Energy, Stormwater, Side Sewer and Grading codes in 

effect on the date of application for renewal; or 

3.2. The work authorized by the permit is substantially underway and progressing at a rate 

approved by the building official. “Substantially underway” means that normally required 

building inspections have been approved for work such as foundations, framing, mechanical, 

insulation and finish work that is being completed on a continuing basis; or 

3.3. Commencement or completion of the work authorized by the permit is delayed by litigation, 

appeals, strikes, or other extraordinary circumstances related to the work authorized by the 

permit, beyond the permit holder’s control, subject to the approval of the building official; or 

3.4. The permit was issued under a version of the Seattle Building Code based on amendments to 

the 2015 or 2018 International Building Code, application for renewal is made prior to 

November 12, 2024 2026, and the applicant claims a hardship related to securing construction or 

permanent financing, in which case the building official shall renew the permit for an additional 

24 months; and 

4. The permit shall not be renewed unless: (a) the building official determines that the permit 

complies, or is modified to comply, with the Seattle Stormwater Code in effect on the date of 

application for renewal; or (b) construction has started. For purposes of this provision, “started 

construction” means the site work associated with and directly related to the approved project 

has begun. For example, grading the project site to final grade or utility installation constitutes 

the start of construction; simply clearing the project site does not. 

950



1

Building Permit Extension Legislation

         Land Use Committee Briefing
             April 2, 2025

Photo by Tim Durkan

951



2

SDCI VISION, PURPOSE, AND VALUES

• Our vision is to set the standard for awesome local government service.

• Our purpose is helping people build a safe, livable, and inclusive Seattle.

• Our values are equity, respect, quality, integrity, and service.

952



3

SUMMARY OF LEGISLATION

• Proposal would amend the 2021 Seattle 
Building Code (SBC) to extend permits for 
projects vested under 2015 and 2018 
codes

• This would allow projects delayed due to 
economic conditions to proceed

• Similar legislation was passed in 2023 
to extend Master Use Permit (MUP) 
lifespans by a year

953



4

PROPOSAL 
• This legislation would amend the 2021 SBC to permit projects vested under the 

2015 and 2018 codes that are experiencing financial hardship by: 

• Providing an additional 24-months to a permit application from the date of the extension 
request for projects still in review.  ~1,100 permits would be able to take advantage of this 
extension.  Without this legislation, they would be subject to cancellation.

• Allowing a permit to renew for an additional 24-months from the date of the extension 
request for issued permits.  ~1,300 issued permits that will expire prior to Nov 1, 2026 
would be able to take advantage of this extension.  ~330 permits have had no activity since 
the end of 2023.  Without this legislation, these permits would expire

• This legislation would also create a sunset clause tied to the next Construction 
Code updates planned for November 2026. 

954



5

BACKGROUND 
• There are 15 projects, mostly downtown, that are delayed due to 

financing.

• These projects represent:

•  $13.4M in estimated sales tax revenue

•  $75M in estimated Mandatory Housing Affordability (MHA) Program 
fees

• Thousands of housing units

• Jobs across a variety of trades

Without this legislation, the permit applications for these projects could 
be cancelled and the projects abandoned, losing critical housing and 
tax revenue. Providing the permit extension to these and other SBC permit 
holders experiencing financial hardship should stimulate development.

955



6

BUILDING CODE UPDATES
• The Seattle Building Code (SBC) is updated every 

three years to improve safety and efficiency.

• Changes include:

•  2018: Enhanced seismic safety and energy requirements, 
changes to size of efficiency dwelling units

•  2021: Changes to accessibility standards ​, allowing a broader 
use of mass timber, elevator out of service and 
decommissioning requirements, and greater flexibility in the 
energy code for existing buildings.

While these updates are important, buildings 
constructed and vested under the older codes 
remain safe.

956



7

IMPACT & JUSTIFICATION

• Ensures feasibility of projects, aligning with the Mayor’s Downtown Activation 

Plan.

• Prevents potential loss of critical housing (29,000+ units in progress/approved).

• Provides certainty to developers while maintaining safety standards.

957



8

QUESTIONS?

Ardel Jala - Building Official, SDCI 

Ardel.Jala@seattle.gov 

Micah Chappell - Technical Code Development Manager, SDCI 

Micah.Chappell@seattle.gov 

958

mailto:Ardel.Jala@seattle.gov
mailto:Micah.Chappell@seattle.gov



